
July 28, 2019 

 
Helping Hand 

Helping Hand Ministry provides a 
meal due to death in the family. Dur-
ing the month of July, please contact 
Jean Byers @ 717-385-9453.  For 
the month of August, please contact 
Jackie Clever @ 717-860-1474. 
 

PSC Address Listing 
You will find updated versions of the 

Prince Street Church Address & Tel-
ephone Listing on the table in the 
chapel. Feel free to help yourself to a 
directory.  Please let the church of-
fice know if your information is 
incorrect or has been omitted.   
Or, if your address has never been 
on the list, you must contact the 
church office directly.  We encour-
age everyone to share their con-
tact information with the church 
family, but we need your permis-
sion. Thank you for your help in 
keeping our records up-to-date. 
 

Mining the Mountains:  
The Daily Dig 

To receive Pastor Mike’s daily devo-
tion, please put your email on your 
Connection Card or call the church 
office.  The devotion will also be 
posted on Prince Street’s Facebook. 
 
 

 
Prayer Corner 

 

Prayer Focus: Pray for children, fami-
lies, and elderly to have a safe sum-
mer. 
 

Psalm for the Week: Psalm 96:1–13 
 

Church of the Week: Oasis of Love 
 

Prince Street’s Ministry Focus: PSUth 
 

Health Needs: 
Holly W. Heidi P. 
Lee H. Rich R. 
Ray B. Marlene B. 
Martha Lou W. Beth R. 
Scott J. Bob H. 
Flo H. Shelby H. 
Rick H. Josh S. 
Pete W. Wendy S. 
Adam H. Alma K. 
Gary T. Denise N. 
Carol C. Jeff L. 
Dave L. Dale M. 
Eldon W. Cheyenne B. 
Carma B. Anita B. 
Boyd M. Beverly M. 
Linda B. Dennis B. 
Rhonda M. Jean C. 
Lynda S. Dave K. 
John P. Ethel C. 
Wayne H. Steve D. 
Samantha P. Jack  

 

Other Needs:  
Tyler Evan 
Tasha Todd 
Joe B. Unspoken (2) 
Relationships New job 
Communications Fair attendees 
Problems with co-workers 
Difficult decisions 
Summit Health employees 
Custody of daughter 
 

Spiritual Needs: 
Michelle B. 
 

Answered Prayers: 
Worship Team 
Daughter found job 
Eye procedure successful 
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 Golf Tournament 
The 2019 U.B. Golf Tournament will 

be held on Friday, September 13, 
2019 at Greencastle Greens Golf 
Club (www.greencastlegolf.com) in 
Greencastle, PA. Once again there 
will be two tee times . . . one at 7:30 
a.m. and the other at 1:00 p.m. The 
cost this year will again be $65.00 
per golfer. A lunch will be served at 
approximately 12:00 Noon and will 
be catered by the golf club 
(Hamburgers, Hot Dogs, Baked 
Beans & Potato Salad). Prizes will 
be awarded for both morning and 
afternoon winners based on flights. 
AGAIN THIS YEAR: We will be 
selling a MULLIGAN, THROW and 
POWER BALL COMBO for $10, so 
come prepared to purchase this ex-
tra help for your game.  The tourna-
ment once again this year will bene-
fit Rhodes Grove Camp and the 
United Brethren Association. 
Registration forms and tournament 

hole sponsor forms are on the table 
in the chapel. 
 

Visit with Brian Weinrick 
Brian Weinrick will be in  the area 

in early August.  He would like to 
visit with his friends while he is 
here.  Many of you will remember 
Brian as he was a part of our church 
family for several years. You are  
invited to a Dessert and Snack Time 
on August 6 at 6:30 p.m. at the 
home of Boyd and Doris Hey, 10 
Hey Drive, Shippensburg.  Dessert 
or Snack will be appreciated.  
Please contact us at 717-423-6781  
if  you plan to attend. 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 

Sunday School 
Sundays - 9:45 - 10:45 am 

Sunday Night - 6:00 pm 
 

Wednesday Night 
Kindle - 6:30 pm 

Mark your Calendars 
You won’t want to miss the fun! 
Back to school weekend-Saturday 

and Sunday, August 17th and 18th. 
Cool at the pool-Saturday August 

17th-7:00—9:00 pm, Shippensburg 
Memorial Pool.  All are welcome.  
The concession stand will be open 
for snack purchases. 
Promotion Sunday-during the Sun-

day School hour.  Come see our 
boys and girls “cross over the 
bridge” to the next class.  Visit our 
classrooms to discover what our 
kids are learning in Sunday School 
this school year, as well as infor-
mation on Wednesday evening ac-
tivities, Children’s Worship hour and 
Christmas programming.  It’s also a 
great time to meet our amazing chil-
dren’s staff. 
Hope to see you at both events. 
 

Corn Festival 
   The Corn Festival Craft Show is 

fast approaching!  Each year at this 
event, we park cars for the people 
attending in our church parking lot. 
There is a paper located on the ta-
ble in the back of the sanctuary list-
ing the different time slots where 
volunteers are needed.  If you can 
help, please select your time and 
sign your name.  All proceeds from 
this event will help fund our commu-
nity meal ministry.  Any questions, 
please contact Brent Black or Jere-
miah Greenland.    
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